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Application Success Stories 

Successful coating of 
complex parts  

Fast and reliable service 
support 

Enormous powder 
savings 

MB Pro Plast 
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Application Success Stories 
Installation Key Data 

2 

Parts:    Job coating 

Scope of delivery:  
3 x OptiFlex® Pro B manual unit  

MB Pro Plast / Serbia 
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Application Success Stories 

3 

“MB Pro Plast” d.o.o is a 
family run company established 
in 2008, considered as one of 
the largest powder coating 
service provider in western 
Serbia and offers as a job 
coating service for large 
companies, with about 150’000 
powder coated square meters a 
year. “MB Pro Plast” d.o.o 

currently has 10 employees and 
is working with all types of 
materials and all types and 
brands of powder.  
 
Segments: automotive industry, 
aluminium profiles, stove panels, 
flue pipes, etc. 
 
 

 
Their qualities: speed, 
maintaining constant and high 
quality as well as providing 
reliable services. Their focus is 
on demanding products and 
challenging clients. For more 
information about their activities 
please visit www.mbpro.rs. 

MB Pro Plast / Serbia 

 

http://www.mbpro.rs/
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